
of this. Opinions differ, and no
one can know for certain what that 
role is. Some see him as follow
ing a two-track policy, negotiating 
with the ANC while giving Inkatha 
just enough space to chip away at 
the ANC's credibility and bargain
ing power. This is plausible, though 
it would be a dangerous tightrope for 
De Klerk to walk - at least as likely 
to produce a kind of social anarchy 
unattractive to De Klerk's cronies in 
the business community as to soften 
up the ANG to be more pliable inter
locutors. More likely, some argue, is 
that De Klerk cannot fully discipline 
his security apparatus which may 
now, to some degree, be operating at 
cross purposes from him. Whatever 
the case, the current situation cer
tainly places the ANC in a partic
ularly awkward position. They are 
inclined to accept De Klerk's bona 
fides for purposes of getting on with 
negotiations but must remain uncer
tain of them, nevertheless. And they 
are inclined to call for state inter
vention to keep the peace but must 
continue to underscore, simultane
ously, the fact that the state cannot 
be trusted to be even-handed in do
ing so.  

These complexities suggest, in 
turn, another question. Could 
Buthelezi have been coopted to the

popular movement by more politi
cal means before things had degen
erated to this point? Could he even 
now be so coopted? A gesture by 
Mandela in this direction earlier this 
year was apparently ruled out of 
order by the ANC when Buthelezi 
tried to force his own extreme terms 
upon any such reconciliation. Was 
Mandela merely being naive about 
Buthelezi's agenda on this occasion 
(or, to take another example, on the 
occasion of his Ted Koppel Town 
Hall appearance when he refused 
an opportunity to expose Buthelezi's 
complicity in the violence as aggres
sively as he sought to expose the 
complicity of the South Africa po
lice)? If so, there now seems even 
less excuse for such naivet6 regard
ing Buthelezi's role and intentions, 
but, with the possibility of Man
dela's meeting with Buthelezi now 
being revived, there may also be less 
room for manouevre. Buthelezi is, 
in effect, holding a gun to Mandela's 
head, and one fears he may be hav
ing some success in his attempt 
running far beyond any legitimate 
claims he might otherwise have - to 
bully his way to the centre of the ne
gotiations table.  

Alternatively, could the MDM 
- the ANC in particular - have

been more successful in grounding 
its political presence in the town
ships in such a way as to erase 
the social tensions that Buthelezi 
and the security forces now seek 
to manipulate? For cooler heads 
have not always prevailed in the 
townships: Inkatha's invocation of 
Zulu identity has sometimes trig
gered counter-ethnic claims, for ex
ample, and the radicalized youth has 
not always acted with the kind of po
litical deftness and diplomacy that 
might help diffuse tensions rather 
than exacerbate them. Perhaps one 
can say that the ANC, deeply hostile 
to "tribalism," deeply committed to 
a smooth transition to democracy, 
has been less effective than might 
have been hoped in establishing its 
active leadership on the ground 
including within the hostels! - in
side South Africa (cf. Anton Har
ber, "The ANC begins to wobble as 
it nears the home straight," Weekly 
Mail, September 21, 1990). But one 
makes such criticisms gingerly, and 
at some risk, if only by implication, 
of permitting an underestimation of 
the ruthlessness of the enemies 
those who seek to turn the townships 
into "killing fields" - who still block 
the road to establishing the premises 
of a peaceful democratic politics in 
South Africa.

Namibia: 
BY COLIN LEYS 

Colin Leys is a professor of politics at 
Queens University and a long time ob
server of the southern Africa scene.  

In November 1989, UN-monitored 
elections brought a victory for 
SWAPO, the South West Africa 
People's Organization, with 57% of 
the popular vote and 41 out of 
72 seats in the Constituent Assem
bly. This was less than the two
thirds majority needed to pass the 
independence constitution, and so 
SWAPO progressively accepted vir
tually all of the constitutional pro
visions originally proposed by the

Five Months After
Contact Group (of which Canada 
was a member) in 1981, guarantee
ing many civil and human rights and 
the independence of the public ser
vice, etc. - guarantees the opposi
tion parties were united in demand
ing. SWAPO induced two opposi
tion leaders to join the new govern
ment and reassured the white pop
ulation by appointing a white busi
nessman (Otto Herrigel) as Minister 
of Finance. The Constituent Assem
bly was converted into the new Na
tional Assembly without a further 
election, SWAPO President Sam 
Nujoma became President of Nami-

bia, and the country became inde
pendent - minus Walvis Bay, which 
South Africa refused to give up - on 
March 21 1990. Recently Colin Leys 
visited Namibia and brought us back 
a report.  
Within hours of arriving in Wind
hoek in July, I met a SWAPO MP 
and asked him how he felt things 
were going. He replied, "People 
are frustrated. They know that it 
takes time to make changes, and 
they want to give the government 
time, but they wonder what is re
ally happening. They don't know 
whether to start making demands

Southern Africa REPORT

IRE

_m

november 1990



~~n0 0h

A snrvivor of the Cassinga massacre teaches children

or whether they should still wait." 
In the next five weeks, I heard 
the same sentiment expressed ev
erywhere. The limitations on the 
SWAPO government's freedom of 
action are recognized (even if some 
- like the clause in the Constitu
tion that prohibits getting rid of 
public servants of the illegal South 
African regime - are seen as un
acceptable). People also accept 
that it takes time for the incoming 
ministers and permanent secretaries 
(deputy ministers in Canadian ter
minology) to initiate changes; and 
they have been told by the Minister 
of Finance that revenue is in short 
supply and that many needed expen
ditures must wait, pending aid nego
tiations. But they also wonder how

far the new government really envis
ages radical change of the kind that 
most Namibians dreamed of during 
the long years of the independence 
struggle - a drastic redistribution of 
education, health and housing re
sources, for example, and of personal 
incomes, between the races.  

The leadership has understand
ably been absorbed by cabinet meet
ings and ministerial duties in Wind
hoek. Only recently have many 
of them moved out of their of
fices, but even then they have not 
given the impression of being keen 
to meet and listen to ordinary peo
ple. It is far more common for 
them to make public speeches at ral
lies where they speak in English,

now the national language, which 
usually only a handful of the audi
ence understand. Their comments 
are laboriously translated, point by 
point, into Afrikaans and two or 
more vernacular languages. The 
long-awaited SWAPO Congress is 
now not to be held until 1992; and 
while intra-party elections have been 
organized, the party does not give 
the impression, as yet, of seeking 
the widest possible democratic input 
into policy-making, let alone seeking 
to make the leadership accountable 
to party members.  

There are good and not so good 
reasons for all this; the point is 
only that the government's popu
larity and legitimacy, its one over-
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whelmingly valuable asset, is being 
heavily drawn upon in this key tran
sitional period. There is a notably 
low level of radical rhetoric, and peo
ple are conscious of it.  

At the same time the radical na
ture of the change that has already 
occurred simply by ending South 
African control, and the war, should 
not be underestimated, above all in 
the north where the fighting took 
place. During the war people lived 
in constant danger of being blown 
up by a land mine, or shot for being 
out during the curfew, or tortured 
on suspicion of having dealings with 
PLAN combatants - or just for not 
being deferential enough.  

An exchange with an Ovambo 
companion on our way north illus
trated this: I asked him what people 
thought about the President's and 
the ministers' salaries, which had 
just been set at the rate of Rand 
20,000 per month plus allowances 
for the President (more than De 
Klerk gets, according to the oppo
sition press) and Rand 16,000 plus 
allowances for ministers. He replied 
that such things concerned people 
like him (an educated professional), 
but not most of the rural population 
in Ovambo. Most people were just 
deeply grateful to be free from fear 
and from white arrogance.  

This is no doubt a significant dif
ference, not just between rural peo
ple in the north, but to some extent 
between northerners and southern
ers (i.e. people from the old "police 
zone," the white settler regions) in 
general.  

There is a deep well of loy
alty for the SWAPO leadership 
in Ovamboland, stemming partly 
from ethnic solidarity and partly 
from the area's distinctive experi
ence of oppression by the military 
and Koevoet (the brutal and lawless 
counter-insurgency force) during the 
war. It was notable that "Namibia 
Day," on August 26, marking the 
first exchange of shots in the war, 
at Omgulumbashe in 1966, proved 
to be almost wholly a northern, if 
not purely Ovambo, affair.

The difficulties facing the new 
government are serious enough - so 
serious, in fact, that one Namibian 
observer, sympathetic to the govern
ment, remarked that the real test 
was whether it could manage to 
"tick over on a good neo-colonial 
course" - not whether it could pro
duce radical changes. The Finance 
Minister's budget speech in July 
contained the following caution: 

Apart from being faced initially with 
a budget deficit of some R556 mil
lion for 1990-91 and a foreign debt 
amounting to R726.5 million, urgent 
attention has to be given to the in
creasing unemployment rate, conser
vatively estimated at 30%, urban
ization and squatting, the escalating 
crime rate, the population growth 
rate of over three per cent, the slug
gish economic growth rate and the il
literacy rate of 65%. In addition, the 
rocketing inflation which we in Na
mibia can hardly influence, increases 
the difficulties with which the new 
independent country has to strug
gle.  

The crime rate escalated, in the 
opinion of the police, following the 
return of the 42,000 exiles from 
abroad before the November 1989 
elections, with residents of the black 
townships as usual bearing the brunt 
of it. While it would be quite wrong 
to attribute all the rise in crime to 
this cause, a UNICEF survey pub
lished in August this year did find 
that only six per cent of the re
turnees of working age had obtained 
"formal sector" jobs. Many have no 
source of income at all.  

The police force, reduced from 
6,000 to some 1,300 of the for
mer "SWAPOL" personnel, has 
been rapidly re-established with 
large numbers of returnees (for
mer SWAPO police from the camps 
in Angola and Zambia and for
mer PLAN fighters), as well as for
mer "special constables" (untrained, 
daily-paid SWAPOL staff). A ma
jor drive to train the new, often 
uneducated, police officers is under 
way. Active steps have been taken 
to change the ethos and image of the
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new force ("NAMPOL") from that 
of a repressive, military-style organi
zation to that of a police service, re
specting and protecting the people.  
But many problems have arisen. At 
one stage President Nujoma ordered 
the army onto the streets in Wind
hoek as a deterrent to criminals.  
Public reactions were mixed, how
ever, and the measure lasted only for 
two weeks.  

A force of 1,500 "border guards," 
recruited entirely from PLAN ex
combatants, was sent to Kavango 
and Caprivi to secure the border 
with the UNITA-controlled region of 
Angola. This force created a new 
problem through its high-handed 
treatment of the local population, 
especially individuals and localities 
seen as loyal to the opposition party, 
the DTA; following mounting at
tacks in the opposition press, in
cluding stories of maltreatment of 
tourists, the "border guards" were 
"withdrawn" by the Prime Minister 
at the beginning of September, and 
the newly-formed Namibian Defence 
Force replaced it along the border.  

Anxieties about the risk of 
destablization by elements in Na
mibia and South Africa opposed to 
the settlement with SWAPO per
sist. After the Namibian newspaper 
reported government concern about 
an alleged coup plot by Namibian 
ex-members of SWATF (the South 
African-controlled Namibian army) 
and Koevoet, its offices were fire
bombed on August 5. It is clear that 
De Klerk has no interest in desta
bilizing the SWAPO government, 
which has everything to gain from 
supporting his negotiation strategy; 
but it is also clear that the SWAPO 
government has at present virtually 
no way of controlling the movement 
in and out of Namibia of South 
African right-wingers with an obvi
ous potential interest in destabiliz
ing it. This applies also to members 
of the so-called "Civilian Coopera
tion Bureau," which seems to have 
been responsible for the murder of 
SWAPO leader Anton Lubowski in 
September last year.  
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Faced with such problems, both 
economic and political, the govern
ment's record to date possibly de
serves more respect than its local 
critics are apt to give it. It has 
dealt, not very clearly, with the 
thorny question of citizenship, of
fering it to most people who have 
lived for five years in Namibia and 
are prepared to renounce any other.  
It has amnestied more than half 
the prison population inherited from 
the colonial regime. It has intro
duced promptly a 200 mile territo
rial limit off the coast, which is es
sential for Namibia to rebuild the 
fish stock and ensure that the na
tional economy gets the benefit. It 
has announced plans to train teach
ers, so that the long process of rec
tifying the gross inequality in school 
provision between races and regions 
can begin (in 1986-87, R329 was 
spent on every Ovambo school stu
dent, compared with R1,071 for ev
ery Herero student, and R3,213 for 
every white student). Plans to rem
edy the similar gross inequalities 
in health services and housing were 
also said to be in hand.  

Given Namibia's situation, few 
quick dramatic changes could be 
made. There are exceptions, how
ever. For example, in the "white 
township" of Oshakati, the main 
military and commercial centre of 
Ovamboland, large houses stood 
empty in August this year, while a 
few hundred metres away the rest of 
the town's population live in what 
are largely shanty-towns almost en
tirely lacking in amenities (and often 
under water, floating in garbage and 
sewage, in the rains). In the vacuum 
left by the abolition of the old "sec
ond tier" (bantustan) Ovambo gov
ernment, perhaps, no policy seems 
to have been adopted for using the 
empty "white" housing in the face 
of so much need. Remarkably, only 
some of the empty houses have been 
squatted in, and only some looted 
for their fittings.  

The government has introduced 
a cautious budget, but one stressing 
the need for expanded public invest
ment. It has had one piece of good

fortune, in that the predicted budget 
deficit has not materialized: on the 
contrary, a small surplus was fore
cast in the budget speech, and the 
economy of the north, which many 
observers expected to collapse with 
the withdrawal of the army, does not 
give the impression of being in ter
minal decline. There is acute un
employment, and so far no plausible 
means of expanding and diversifying 
the Ovambo economy has been pro
posed. Yet the region does not seem 
depressed. The big supermarkets 
in Oshakati and Ondangua are not 
full of people, but they are still full 
of goods. The explanation may lie 
partly in the revival of cross-border 
trade with Angola, which the end 
of the PLAN-South Africa war has 
made possible in this sector. But 
Ovambo business acumen and thrift 
should not be underestimated either.  
A great deal turns on what happens 
in this region, which contains half 
of the population, including 80% of 
the unemployed returnees, whose ex
pectations have been raised by their 
sacrifices in combat and their edu
cation and politicization in Angola 
and overseas.  

SWAPO's socialist policy pro
gramme of 1976 now seems a dis
tant memory. One socialist I met 
remarked that when he and a friend 
tried to count all the socialists they 
knew in the country, they could 
only think of six. Allowing for 
some exaggeration, it is still prob
ably true that outside the ranks 
of NANSO, the student organiza
tion, very few people have other 
than liberal-egalitarian ideas and 
hopes, within the framework of a 
broadly individualistic, private en
terprise economy. The question is 
rather whether a significant number 
of the SWAPO leadership are deter
mined to bring about a much more 
equal society. It is too soon to tell.  
Some observers feel that under the 
watchword of "reconciliation," the 
new government has been accommo
dating itself all too rapidly to the in
herited structure of power and sta
tus. Others see many of the old

leaders, in spite of their long years 
of dependency on the international 
community, as nonetheless dogged 
and persistent champions of the na
tional cause, who will never be con
tent merely to manage the old racial
ist and exploitative system, how
ever gradual and limited the changes 
they may seek.  

Municipal and regional elections, 
due in the next 18 months, will give 
some pointers, as will the 1991 bud
get, and the specific policies on hous
ing, health, land reform and mining 
revenues that emerge over the com
ing year. Individual leadership ap
pointments will also be significant.  
For those who believe that a "mafia" 
of Ovambo "securocrats" will even
tually entrench themselves perma
nently in power, the deferment, in 
the face of a public outcry, of the 
appointment of Solomon Hawala as 
Army Chief of Staff of Solomon 
Hawala (Hawala was PLAN chief 
of security during the torturing of 
the "SWAPO detainees" in An
gola), may force some reconsidera
tion. The impulse to behave as if 
the SWAPO leadership were still an 
untouchable power elite, secure in 
their exile headquarters, may still 
be there, but it is no longer unchal
lenged. Other, more cosmopolitan 
and progressive tendencies are also 
evident.  

On the other hand, the DTA 
and most of the smaller opposi
tion parties are noticeably lacking in 
constructive ideas, and are mostly 
still discredited by their participa
tion in the South African-sponsored 
"interim government" prior to 1989.  
The trade union movement, whose 
pre-independence growth was im
pressive, has been placed under 
SWAPO tutelage by the insertion 
of the exile leader John Ya Otto as 
General Secretary of the National 
Union of Namibian Workers over 
Ben Ulenga, its internal leader. In 
general, the lack of democratic tra
ditions in most sectors of Namibian 
society under South African occu
pation means that for the moment, 
the initiative lies very much with the 
government.
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